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NO, complaints about this beautiful Sunday, the weather was perfect; our Sunday Church Service was a real 
Blessing, Thanks to John Gorton; our picnic out under our apple tree was delicious and very enjoyable and then 
we came in and had our little nap which was very comforting.   Oh, for my flowers today for Church as I usually 
take a bouquet from neighbors that let me pick from their gardens.  BUT today I picked from my own wild 
garden of Jack-in –a pulpits, I have several that came up this year, and one was given to me about 35-40 years 
ago,  John Gordon had a quiet visitor in the pulpit with him today, he had not looked at one close up and this 
one got a good looking over.  Sandy Bowman wanted to take it and plant it at her home,  it came up out of the 
ground so easy and had nice roots to replant.  I’m sure she will have good luck with it.  

During this beautiful day, Donna  St.Onge came home and spent a few hours with her mother Lorraine.  She 
took her mom for a ride in her chariot (wheel chair) down to the Village Park.  The park had been newly 
mowed, and the flower beds had been groomed and it was a nice day to get out of the house.   I am sure 
Lorraine had a wonderful afternoon with her daughter. 

Congratulations to all the Montgomery Graduates that graduated this past Saturday in Enosburg, with the 
Graduation Exercise held on Lincoln Park.  It was such a beautiful day and each student  went up on the 
bandstand to receive their diploma and came down and stood there to have their picture taken.  
Congratulations to Connor Walker, Trillian Howell, Alexis Madden, Isaac Lumbra, MacKenzie Maibaum, 
Wonder Billadeau, Madeline Spaulding.  You have every right to be proud of your achievements, wishing you a 
wonderful future whatever you decide to do, Good Luck!!

Michael Domina and Roger Hatch arrived in town Friday afternoon to spend the weekend with his mother Gila 
Domina.  They plan to go and visit Michael’s sister Ruth and Family on Monday, and leave to go back to 
Massachusetts on Tuesday.  Maybe Mike and Ruth will celebrate their Birthdays together as they are both the 
same week.  

Happy Birthday to:  Lindsay Snider, Linda Green, Wyatt Stanley 6/20; Linda Carpenter, Scott  Joyal 6/21; Lila 
Elkins, Billy Baker sr. 6/23; Sonny Lumbra, Lisa Greco 6/24; Abilgail Paradis, Dylan Baker, 6/25.  

Anniversary Wishes to:   Morgan & Beth Crane-Daybell;  Tim & Sam Murphy 6/21;  Randy & Stacey St.Onge; 
Bobby & Patty Anderson; Mike & Linda Carpenter;  Eric & Bethany Remmers 6/25.   Congratulations!!

** Father’s Day Humor: #1 Science teacher ask students, When is the boiling point reached?   Student..When 
my Father sees my report card.  **  #2 Teacher answering the phone, You say Michael has a cold and can’t 
come to school today?   To whom am I speaking to?  The voice..This is my Father..**   This Sunday June 19 is 
Father’s Day, Let him know how much you LOVE him.  God Bless!!  M.L.T.A. 

  


